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papers and others at advanced stage of review, and with an exciting and important research 
pipeline based on high quality data, she is on an excellent trajectory." 

Reviewer (D) 
'•Without reservation and with great enthusiasm, I write to recommend Sara Soderstrom for 
promotion to Associate Professor with Tenure at the University of Michigan. It is a pleasure to 
review Soderstrom's fascinating research ...... [her] research is theoretically groundbreaking .. . 
methodologically creative ... and elaborates fascinating and important phenomena ... As such. 
her work is of central importance to organization theorists as well as to scholars in sociology 
and the environment." 

Reviewer (E) 
"Dr. Soderstrom is a nationally recognized scholar of organizations and sustainability .... I have 
seen Dr. Soderstrom's work cited in articles I have read and among colleagues that I have 
talked to about issues of sustainability and organizations and the natural environment. Dr.  
Soderstrom's name often comes up. This is a signal to me that she is respected as a scholar. .. " 

Reviewer (F) 
"These papers are all highly novel theoretically and marshal unique and compelling data .... 
. . . she is a qualitative researcher focusing on unique settings and topics; qualitative research 
takes longer to do and longer to get published ...... she has produced very high-quality, 
innovative research in a substantively important domain." 

Summary of Recommendation: 
Professor Soderstrom is conducting innovative and cutting-edge work on a topic of crucial 
importance-namely, the ways in which organizations are working toward a sustainable future. 
She has established herself as an outstanding classroom teacher and a dedicated mentor or 
students. Her sen ice work in her units, the college, the university, and the profession is 
exemplary. The Executive Committee of the College of Literature, Science, and the Arts and I 
recommend that Assistant Professor Sara B. Soderstrom be promoted to the rank of associate 
professor of organizational studies, with tenure, College of Literature, Science, and the Arts, 
and associate professor of environment, without tenure, School for Environment and 
Sustainability and College of Literature, Science, and the Arts. 
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